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This Questionnaire is intended to collect information relating to academics and general facilities 
of the institution. 

S. No Description
Excellent

(5)

Very
Good

(4)

Good
 (3)

Average
 (2)

Poor
 (1)

1
Relevance of the curriculum to 
the current needs of the global 
job market

2

The scope of the current 
curriculum in making the 
student think critically and 
globally competent is adequate.

3
The Course syllabus has a 
good balance between theory 
and Lab

4
The curriculum addresses most 
of the Program Outcomes and 
Program Specific Outcomes.

5
The curriculum meets the 
prescribed norms of APSCHE 
and other regulatory bodies.

6
Curriculum gaps identified in 
previous meetings are 
adequately addressed.

7

I have the freedom to propose, 
modify, suggest and incorporate
new topics in the syllabus 
through proper procedure. 

8

The Institution has good 
teaching-learning infrastructural 
facilities for imparting quality 
education.

9
The Institution has a conducive 
ambiance to promote innovation
and creativity.

10
The Institution has a fair 
evaluation system and it is 
transparent.

11
The Institution encourages 
faculty to take part in 
workshops, FDPs, PDPs, etc.

Signature of Faculty


